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The book «Geneva through the night» is 
a high quality publication, printed and 
bound in Switzerland. The book contains 
over 100 unpublished photographs ac-
companied by descriptions and reference 
information in French and English.

PERSONALIZATION OF THE BOOK

This book can be ordered in the standard 
version or customized according to your 
needs. For example we can incorporate a 
company logo and accompanying text on 
an extra jaquette cover. The book could 
be packed in a special box etc.

It is also possible to take additional pictu-
res of the institution and integrate it into 
the publication.

EDITION IN OTHER LANGUAGES

The book includes texts in French and 
English. However it is possible to publish 
the book in other languages.

PRINTS OF PHOTOGRAPHS

In addition to this book, we are able to 
offer prints of the photographs published 
in  this edition. Each photograph is print-
ed in limited and numbered copies, ac-
companied by a certificate of authenticity. 
They come in various finishing solutions: 
collage on aluminum, in acrylic, American 
framework etc.
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« GENÈVE AU FIL DE LA NUIT, GENEVA THROUGH THE NIGHT »



INTRODUCTION

There are many ways to discover Geneva. 
This promenade, led by the play of co-
lours and lights of the city is spectacular, 
because the city takes a particular ap-
pearance during twilight hours.

Mike Gorsky testifies in this book of this 
amazing transformation that allows Ge-
neva to be born again in another form 
through these different lights which at-
tach to stones, trees, the lake and create 
a mysterious atmosphere.

He leads us in familiar places but rarely 
or even never perceived under the light 
of dusk, because this magical moment of 
transition from day to night lasts only a 
few minutes and one simply has no time 
to appreciate this moment. contempler.

ABOUT THE AUTHOR

Mike Gorsky is a professional photogra-
pherl specilizing in architectural end in-
terior photography, portrait and corporate 
identity. His portfolio can be viewed at the 
website: www.mgstudio.ch

PUBLISHING DETAILS

Size:   	 280 x 240 mm

Number 
of pages:  	 160 pages + cover

Paper:	 Couché, 1/2 mat, 170 gr.

Cover:  	 Hardcover

Languages:		 French, English	  
		  (It is possible to edit this 

		   book in other languages)

Publisher: 	 Imagine-Media

ISBN:

The book contains over 90 unpublished 
photographs. All photos are accompanied 
by descriptions and reference informati-
on in French and English.

CONCEPT

Title:	 Genève au fil de la nuit, Geneva through the night

Author:	 Mike Gorsky

Parution:	 Novembre 2014

http://www.mgstudio.ch


PUBLISHING DETAILS

Size:  		  280 x 240 mm

Number 
of pages:  		  160 pages + couverture

Paper:		  Couché, 1/2 mat, 170 gr.

Cover:  		  Hardcover

Languages:		  French, English

Public price: 		  CHF 68.−

The book contains over 90 unpublished photographs.

TARIFFS

Title:	 Genève au fil de la nuit, Geneva throught the night

Author:	 Mike Gorsky

Parution:	 Novembre 2014

Quantity Discount:
Price per unit 

vat incl:
Shipping costs 

vat incl:

10 − 29 copies 15% CHF 57.80 CHF 30.00

30 − 49 copies 20% CHF 54.40 CHF 50.00

50 − 99 copies 25% CHF 51.00 CHF 69.00

100 copies and more 30% CHF 47.60 contact us

200 copies and more contact us

TARIFFS
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IMAGINE PUBLISHING HOUSE

ABOUT IMAGINE-MEDIA

Imagine-Media is a media, public re-
lations and corporate design company 
specializing in providing high-quality 
corporate publishing, media content, 
design, marketing strategy and branding 
for international and multilingual compa-
nies.

Imagine is the only media & communica-
tion agency in Switzerland which provi-
des the services in Russian language in 
addition to the French and English.

Our expertise:
-	 Publishing
-	 Communication
-	 Corporate identity
-	 Art direction
-	 Photography & Videography

CONTACTS

IMAGINE-MEDIA
22, Rue de la Terrassière

CH- 1207 Genève

Mr.Mikhail Goussarov
Director
+41(22) 736 17 26
+41(79) 205 18 68
info@imagine-media.ch

www.imagine–media.ch

OUR PUBLICATIONS

mailto:info%40imagine-media.ch?subject=Livre%20de%20photos%20%22Gen%C3%A8ve%20au%20fil%20de%20la%20nuit%22
http://www.imagine-media.ch

